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Wardono Unnes <wardono@mail.unnes.ac.id> 
 

Min, 28 Agu 
2016, 00.04

kepada editorjatit 

 
 

Dear Editor JATIT 

Here is my email it about Agreement Form JATIT   

to complete submit our articles to JATIT. 

Thank you very much 

Best regards, 

Wardono et all 

 

 

27 Agustus 2016 

Agreement Form Journal of Theoretical and Applied 
Information Technology 
Kotak Masuk 

 
editor editor@jatit.org lewat core6.hostingmadeeasy.com  
 

Sab, 27 Agu 
2016, 23.08

kepada saya 

 
 

Inggris 

Indonesia 
    
Terjemahkan pesan 

Nonaktifkan untuk: Inggris 

 

Satu lampiran • Dipindai dengan Gmail 
  

 
Wardono Unnes <wardono@mail.unnes.ac.id> 
 

Min, 28 Agu 
2016, 00.07

kepada editor 

 
 

Dear Editor JATIT 



Here is my email it about  Agreement Form JATIT to complete submit our 

articles to JATIT. 

Thank you very much 

Best regards 

Wardono, et all 

 
On Sat, Aug 27, 2016 at 11:08 PM, editor <editor@jatit.org> wrote: 
 
 
 

Satu lampiran • Dipindai dengan Gmail 
  

 

BalasTeruskan 

 

 

23 September 2016 

[JATIT] Letter of Acceptance for Submitted Research 
Paper ID 31291-JATIT 
Kotak Masuk 

 
Journal of Theoretical and Applied Information Technology <editorjatit@gmail.com> 
 

Jum, 23 Sep 
2016, 22.12

kepada saya, agoestanto, sitirosidah1495 

 
 

Inggris 

Indonesia 
    
Terjemahkan pesan 

Nonaktifkan untuk: Inggris 

Dear Corresponding Author Dr Wardono, M.Si 
 
We are pleased to inform you that your paper titled "ARIMA METHOD WITH THE  SOFTWARE MINITAB 
AND  EVIEWS  TO FORECAST  INFLATION  IN SEMARANG INDONESIA" Paper ID: 31291 

- 
JATIT  having author(s):  
WARDONO,  ARIEF AGOESTANTO, SITI ROSIDAH has been conditionally accepted for 
publication in peer reviewed and indexed [SCOPUS, EBSCO, DOAJ, ULRICH, DBLP, Google Scholar, Itrc, Nlm Cat, 

Creaa, Iisj, TOC, CSJ, CASC, Microsoft Academic Search,Cabell Publishing, INSPEC, Openjgate, IAOR, Palgrave Macmillan, 

ProQuest, etc]  JOURNAL OF THEORETICAL AND APPLIED INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY (E-
ISSN 1817-3195 / ISSN 1992-8645). The acceptance decision was based on the reviewers' evaluation after 
double blind peer review and chief editor's approval.[Attached with this notification]c 
You have to proceed with submission of OA processing fee ($325) via credit card transaction through 
our online payment system (Use any valid credit card of Yourself / Friend / Family etc) . Please submit 
the dues on our secure payment submission system at 
https://pay.paddle.com/checkout/507133  
 
so that your paper may get published in upcoming issues. (please forward us with the receipt 



generated after the completed payment process so that we can easily track your payment). The billing 
info that appears on your cc statement shall have a reference of JATIT. (Any Authentic Credit Card of 
Yourself / Friend / Family etc can be legitimately used). 
 
You can submit the  OA processing fee via wire transfer directly to the following bank account (US 
$325 or equivalent in local currency as  publication dues) 
 
>> Bank Account Title:    Journal Of Theoretical And Applied Information Technology  
>> Bank Account No.      17427901524455  
>> IBAN:                        PK77HABB0017427901524455                        
>> Swift Code:               HABBPKKAXXX  
>> Bank Name:              Habib Bank Shalimar Recording. Co. Branch H-9, Islamabad Pakistan.  
>> JATIT Address:         House No 154 (G), Street No 8, Sector F-15/1, Islamabad, Pakistan.  
 
Forward the scanned receipt after making the payments so that the transaction be traced. Instruct the 
bank to set the option of transaction transfer charges as ours. There is also an option of urgent 
publication fee ($500) available for urgent publication.  
 
Kindly also submit a camera ready copy (CRC) with updates as per evaluation in Ms Word document 
and journal (two column) format [attached with this acceptance letter] to 
address publisher@jatit.org "Mr. Shahzad" after registration fee submission and copyright for the 
same. 
 
Kindly proceed with processing OA fee submission for slot allocation for limited slots in the Vol 93 / 
Vol 94 Issues of JATIT to be assigned on first registration basis. CRC copies can be submitted at a 
later time after slot reservation. A certificate of publication can also be provided on demand after 
submission of publication dues if required earlier than publication time for official use. 
 
We shall encourage more quality submissions from you and your colleagues in future. 
 
Regards, 
 
Shahbaz Ghayyur 
Co-Chief Editor 
Editorial office 
Journal of Theoretical and Applied Information Technology 
editor@jatit.org / editorjatit@gmail.com 
 
*/ JATIT is widely distributed in print and electronic from and is also indexed with major indexing 
agencies making its visibility and citation potential higher than its competitors. JATIT it is now officially 
recommended by a number of universities and scientific institutions worldwide for publication of 
research which is the source of its high submission rate and quality. We are also trying to further 
improve its flow and visibility by a number of collaborative efforts. Latest indexing information is 
available at the indexing and abstracting page at www.jatit.org.*/ 
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Dear Shahbaz Ghayyur 
Co-Chief Editor 
Editorial office 

Journal of Theoretical and Applied Information Technology 
 
Thank you for the information. We agreed to make a payment by credit card as soon 
as possible. If we have made a payment roughly when our paper was published? 
Thank you 
 
 
Best regards 
 
 
Dr. Wardono, et all 
 

 
Wardono Unnes <wardono@mail.unnes.ac.id> 
 

Sen, 26 Sep 
2016, 01.17

kepada editor 

 
 

Dear Shahbaz Ghayyur 
Co-Chief Editor 
Editorial office 

Journal of Theoretical and Applied Information Technology 
 
Thank you for the information. We agreed to make a payment by credit card as soon 
as possible. If we have made a payment roughly when our paper was published? 
Thank you 
 
 
Best regards 
 
Dr. Wardono, et all 
 

 
Wardono Unnes <wardono@mail.unnes.ac.id> 
 

Sel, 27 Sep 
2016, 07.48

kepada editor 

 
 

This is the receipt of my completed payment for publishing the journal : 



 
Paper titled "ARIMA METHOD WITH THE  SOFTWARE MINITAB AND  EVIEWS  TO 
FORECAST  INFLATION  IN SEMARANG INDONESIA" Paper ID: 31291 

- 
JATIT  having author(s):  

WARDONO,  ARIEF AGOESTANTO, SITI ROSIDAH  
 
Please kindly check it and process it. Thank you. 
 
Best regards, 
Dr Wardono, M.Si 
Universitas Negeri Semarang (Semarang State University) 
 
Satu lampiran • Dipindai dengan Gmail 

  

 

BalasTeruskan 

 

9 Desember 2016 

Camera ready article, reply to reviewer document, 
copyright, payment for publication, article edit before 
becoming camera ready article. 

 
Wardono Unnes <wardono@mail.unnes.ac.id> 
 

Jum, 9 Des 
2016, 23.16

kepada editor 

 
 

Dear Editor JATIT 

We author of the article with the ID 31291. We have email it camera ready 

copy of the article satisfying reviewers are comments, reply to reviewer of 

document, copyright, payment for the publication and article edit before 

becoming a camera ready articles  . We hope that our article can be 

published in Volume 94 Issue 1 December 15, 2016. 

Best Regards 

 

Dr. Wardono, M.Si 

Universitas Negeri  Semarang, Indonesia. 

 

 

13 Desember 2016 

Camera Ready Copy of Article, Reply to reviewers 
document, Copy right, Payment for the publication 
Kotak Masuk 

 



Wardono Unnes <wardono@mail.unnes.ac.id> 
 

Jum, 9 Des 
2016, 22.55

kepada editor 

 
 

Dear Editor JATIT 

We author of the article with the ID 31291. We have email it camera ready 

copy of the article satisfying reviewers are comments, reply to reviewer of 

document, copyright, payment for the publication and article edit before 

becoming a camera ready articles  . We hope that our article can be 

published in Volume 94 Issue 1 December 15, 2016. 

Best Regards 

 

Dr. Wardono, M.Si 

Universitas Negeri  Semarang, Indonesia. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



3 Januari 2017 

Submit Article 

 
Wardono Unnes <wardono@mail.unnes.ac.id> 
 

Sel, 3 Jan 
2017, 23.32

kepada editor 

 
 

Dear Editor JATIT 

We have email article with title  IMPLEMENTATION OF AUTOREGRESSIVE 

INTREGATED MOVING AVERAGE (ARIMA) METHODS FOR FORECASTING A SIM SERVICE 

USING Eviews 7 

PATI IN INDONESIA. May be accepted and published in JATIT.  

Thanks. 

Best regards, 

 

 Wardono et al 

Satu lampiran • Dipindai dengan Gmail 
  

 
Wardono Unnes <wardono@mail.unnes.ac.id> 
 

Sel, 3 Jan 
2017, 23.37

kepada editorjatit, editor, bcc: editor 

 
 

Dear Editor JATIT 

We have email article with title  IMPLEMENTATION OF AUTOREGRESSIVE 

INTREGATED MOVING AVERAGE (ARIMA) METHODS FOR FORECASTING SIM A SERVICE 

USING Eviews 7 

IN PATI INDONESIA. May be accepted and published in JATIT.  

Satu lampiran • Dipindai dengan Gmail 
  

 

BalasBalas ke semuaTeruskan 

 

8 Januari 2017  

Submit Article 
Kotak Masuk 

 
Wardono Unnes <wardono@mail.unnes.ac.id> 
 

Jum, 6 Jan 
2017, 14.29

kepada editor, editorjatit, bcc: editor 

 
 

Dear Editor JATIT 



We have email article with title  IMPLEMENTATION OF AUTOREGRESSIVE 

INTREGATED MOVING AVERAGE (ARIMA) METHODS FOR FORECASTING A SIM SERVICE 

USING Eviews 7 

PATI IN INDONESIA. May be accepted and published in JATIT.  

Thanks. 

Best regards, 

 

 Wardono et al 

Satu lampiran • Dipindai dengan Gmail 
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2017, 09.50

kepada saya 

 
 

Inggris 

Indonesia 
    
Terjemahkan pesan 

Nonaktifkan untuk: Inggris 

Dear Author  
 
We processing your paper with ID 31949-JATIT. We shall get back to you when the 
evaluation of your paper is complete.  
 
Regards 
 
Editorial Office 
JATIT 
 

 

BalasTeruskan 

 

9 Januari 2017  

Agreement Form Journal of Theoretical and Applied 
Information Technology 
Kotak Masuk 

 
editor editor@jatit.org lewat core6.hostingmadeeasy.com  
 

Min, 8 Jan 
2017, 09.49

kepada saya 

 
 

Inggris 

Indonesia 



    
Terjemahkan pesan 

Nonaktifkan untuk: Inggris 

 

Satu lampiran • Dipindai dengan Gmail 
  

 
Wardono Unnes <wardono@mail.unnes.ac.id> 
 

Sen, 9 Jan 
2017, 19.17

kepada editor 

 
 

Dear Editor JATIT 
Here is my email it about Agreement Form JATIT  
to complete submit our articles with ID 31949-JATIT to JATIT. 
Thank you very much 
Best regards, 
  
Dr. Wardono, M.Si et all 
 
On Sun, Jan 8, 2017 at 9:49 AM, editor <editor@jatit.org> wrote: 
 
 
 

Satu lampiran • Dipindai dengan Gmail 
  

 

BalasTeruskan 
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Wardono Unnes <wardono@mail.unnes.ac.id> 
 

kepada editor, editor, bcc: editorjatit 

 
 

Dear Editor JATIT 
Here is my email it about Agreement Form JATIT  
to complete submit our articles with ID 31949-JATIT to JATIT. 
Thank you very much 



Best regards, 
  
Dr. Wardono, M.Si et all 
 

Satu lampiran • Dipindai dengan Gmail 
  

 

BalasBalas ke semuaTeruskan 
 

 

Agreement Form JATIT with ID 31949-JATIT 

 
Wardono Unnes <wardono@mail.unnes.ac.id> 
 

Sen, 9 Jan 
2017, 19.21

kepada editor, editor, bcc: editorjatit 

 
 

Dear Editor JATIT 
Here is my email it about Agreement Form JATIT  
to complete submit our articles with ID 31949-JATIT to JATIT. 
Thank you very much 
Best regards, 
  
Dr. Wardono, M.Si et all 
 

Satu lampiran • Dipindai dengan Gmail 
  

 

BalasBalas ke semuaTeruskan 
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[JATIT] Letter of Acceptance for Submitted Research 
Paper ID 31898-JATIT 
Kotak Masuk 

 
Journal of Theoretical and Applied Information Technology <editorjatit@gmail.com> 
 

Sab, 14 Jan 
2017, 21.08

kepada scmariani.unnes, saya, fwaratkhurokhmanfauzi 

 
 

Inggris 

Indonesia 
    
Terjemahkan pesan 

Nonaktifkan untuk: Inggris 

Dear Corresponding Author Scolastika Mariani 
 
We are pleased to inform you that your paper titled "THE COMBINED ArcVIEW AND GeoDa 
APPLICATION IN OPTIMIZATION OF SPATIAL REGRESSION ESTIMATE" Paper ID: 31898 

- 
JATIT  having author(s):  
SCOLASTIKA MARIANI, WARDONO,  MASRUKAN ,  FATKHUROKHMAN FAUZI has 
been conditionally accepted for publication in peer reviewed and indexed [SCOPUS, EBSCO, DOAJ, 

ULRICH, DBLP, Google Scholar, Itrc, Nlm Cat, Creaa, Iisj, TOC, CSJ, CASC, Microsoft Academic Search,Cabell Publishing, 

INSPEC, Openjgate, IAOR, Palgrave Macmillan, ProQuest, etc]  JOURNAL OF THEORETICAL AND APPLIED 
INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY (E-ISSN 1817-3195 / ISSN 1992-8645). The acceptance decision was 
based on the reviewers' evaluation after double blind peer review and chief editor's approval.[Attached with 

this notification]c 
You have to proceed with submission of OA processing fee ($325) via credit card transaction through 
our online payment system (Use any valid credit card of Yourself / Friend / Family etc) . Please submit 
the dues on our secure payment submission system at 
https://pay.paddle.com/checkout/507133 
 
so that your paper may get published in upcoming issues. (please forward us with the receipt 
generated after the completed payment process so that we can easily track your payment). The billing 
info that appears on your cc statement shall have a reference of JATIT. (Any Authentic Credit Card of 
Yourself / Friend / Family etc can be legitimately used). 
 
You can submit the  OA processing fee via wire transfer directly to the following bank account (US 
$325 or equivalent in local currency as  publication dues) 
 
>> Bank Account Title:    Journal Of Theoretical And Applied Information Technology  
>> Bank Account No.      17427901524455  
>> IBAN:                        PK77HABB0017427901524455                        
>> Swift Code:               HABBPKKAXXX  
>> Bank Name:              Habib Bank Shalimar Recording. Co. Branch H-9, Islamabad Pakistan.  
>> JATIT Address:         House No 154 (G), Street No 8, Sector F-15/1, Islamabad, Pakistan.  
 
Forward the scanned receipt after making the payments so that the transaction be traced. Instruct the 
bank to set the option of transaction transfer charges as ours.  
There is also an option of urgent publication fee ($650) available for urgent publication of paper.  
 
Kindly also submit a camera ready copy (CRC) with updates as per evaluation in Ms Word document 
and journal (two column) format [attached with this acceptance letter] to 
address publisher@jatit.org "Mr. Shahzad" after registration fee submission and copyright for the 
same. 



 
Kindly proceed with processing OA fee submission for publication slot allocation in the March or April 
Issues of JATIT to be assigned on first OA fee submission basis. CRC copies can be submitted at a 
later time after slot reservation. A certificate of publication can also be provided on demand after 
submission of publication dues if required earlier than publication time for official use. 
 
We shall encourage more quality submissions from you and your colleagues in future. 
 
Regards, 
 
Shahbaz Ghayyur  

Co-Chief Editor  
Editorial office 
Journal of Theoretical and Applied Information Technology 
editor@jatit.org / editorjatit@gmail.com 
 
*/ JATIT is widely distributed in print and electronic from and is also indexed with major indexing 
agencies making its visibility and citation potential higher than its competitors. JATIT it is now officially 
recommended by a number of universities and scientific institutions worldwide for publication of 
research which is the source of its high submission rate and quality. We are also trying to further 
improve its flow and visibility by a number of collaborative efforts. Latest indexing information is 
available at the indexing and abstracting page at www.jatit.org.*/fazal.manuu@gmail.com 
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[JATIT] Letter of Acceptance for Submitted Research 
Paper ID 31949-JATIT 
Kotak Masuk 

 
Journal of Theoretical and Applied Information Technology <editorjatit@gmail.com> 
 

Rab, 18 Jan 
2017, 03.19

kepada saya, Scolastika, yuliyanafathonah17 

 
 

Inggris 

Indonesia 
    
Terjemahkan pesan 

Nonaktifkan untuk: Inggris 

Dear Corresponding Author Wardono 
 
We are pleased to inform you that your paper titled "IMPLEMENTATION OF AUTOREGRESSIVE 
INTREGATED MOVING AVERAGE (ARIMA) METHODS FOR FORECASTING SERVICE SIM A USING 
EVIEWS 7 IN PATI INDONESIA" Paper ID: 31949 

- 
JATIT  having author(s):  
WARDONO, SCOLASTIKA MARIANI,  YULIYANA FATHONAH has been conditionally accepted for 
publication in peer reviewed and indexed [SCOPUS, EBSCO, DOAJ, ULRICH, DBLP, Google Scholar, Itrc, Nlm Cat, 

Creaa, Iisj, TOC, CSJ, CASC, Microsoft Academic Search,Cabell Publishing, INSPEC, Openjgate, IAOR, Palgrave Macmillan, 

ProQuest, etc]  JOURNAL OF THEORETICAL AND APPLIED INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY (E-
ISSN 1817-3195 / ISSN 1992-8645). The acceptance decision was based on the reviewers' evaluation after 
double blind peer review and chief editor's approval.[Attached with this notification]c 
You have to proceed with submission of OA processing fee ($325) via credit card transaction through 
our online payment system (Use any valid credit card of Yourself / Friend / Family etc) . Please submit 
the dues on our secure payment submission system at 
https://pay.paddle.com/checkout/507133 
 
so that your paper may get published in upcoming issues. (please forward us with the receipt 
generated after the completed payment process so that we can easily track your payment). The billing 
info that appears on your cc statement shall have a reference of JATIT. (Any Authentic Credit Card of 
Yourself / Friend / Family etc can be legitimately used). 
 
You can submit the  OA processing fee via wire transfer directly to the following bank account (US 
$325 or equivalent in local currency as  publication dues) 
 
>> Bank Account Title:    Journal Of Theoretical And Applied Information Technology  
>> Bank Account No.      17427901524455  
>> IBAN:                        PK77HABB0017427901524455                        
>> Swift Code:               HABBPKKAXXX  
>> Bank Name:              Habib Bank Shalimar Recording. Co. Branch H-9, Islamabad Pakistan.  
>> JATIT Address:         House No 154 (G), Street No 8, Sector F-15/1, Islamabad, Pakistan.  
 
Forward the scanned receipt after making the payments so that the transaction be traced. Instruct the 
bank to set the option of transaction transfer charges as ours.  
There is also an option of urgent publication fee ($650) available for urgent publication of paper.  
 



Kindly also submit a camera ready copy (CRC) with updates as per evaluation in Ms Word document 
and journal (two column) format [attached with this acceptance letter] to 
address publisher@jatit.org "Mr. Shahzad" after registration fee submission and copyright for the 
same. 
 
Kindly proceed with processing OA fee submission for publication slot allocation in the March / April 
2017 Issues of JATIT to be assigned on first OA fee submission basis. CRC copies can 
be submitted at a later time after slot reservation. A certificate of publication can also be provided on 
demand after submission of publication dues if required earlier than publication time for official use. 
 
We shall encourage more quality submissions from you and your colleagues in future. 
 
Regards, 
 
Shahbaz Ghayyur  

Co-Chief Editor  
Editorial office 
Journal of Theoretical and Applied Information Technology 
editor@jatit.org / editorjatit@gmail.com 
 
*/ JATIT is widely distributed in print and electronic from and is also indexed with major indexing 
agencies making its visibility and citation potential higher than its competitors. JATIT it is now officially 
recommended by a number of universities and scientific institutions worldwide for publication of 
research which is the source of its high submission rate and quality. We are also trying to further 
improve its flow and visibility by a number of collaborative efforts. Latest indexing information is 
available at the indexing and abstracting page at www.jatit.org.*/ 
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BalasBalas ke semuaTeruskan 

 
 
 
26 Maret 2017   

 

Submit Article 

 
Wardono Unnes <wardono@mail.unnes.ac.id> 
 

Min, 26 Mar 
2017, 23.41

kepada editor, editorjatit, bcc: editor 

 
 

Dear Editor JATIT 
We have email article with title : ANALYSIS OF MATHEMATICS TEACHER 
PERFORMANCE IN SEMARANG INDONESIA USING STRUCTURAL 
EQUATION MODELING (SEM) WITH LISREL AND SPSS. 
May be accepted and published in JATIT. 
Thanks. 
Best regards, 
  
Dr. Wardono, M.Si & Dr. Scolastika Mariani, M.Si 

Satu lampiran • Dipindai dengan Gmail 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



  

 

BalasBalas ke semuaTeruskan 

 

3 April 2017  

aper ID 31949 JATIT Camera Ready, Reply to Reviewer, 
Copyright, Payment, Article Edit before becoming 
Camera Ready 
Kotak Masuk 

 
Wardono Unnes <wardono@mail.unnes.ac.id> 
 

Min, 2 Apr 
2017, 23.29

kepada editor, editorjatit, bcc: editor 

 
 

Dear Editor JATIT 
We author of the article with the Paper ID 31949 JATIT . We have email it camera ready 
copy of the article satisfying reviewers are comments, reply to reviewer of document, 
copyright, payment for the publication and article edit before becoming a camera ready 
articles . We hope that our article can be published in Vol.95 Issues 7 or 8 (April 15 / April 
30 2017 ). 
Best Regards 
  
Dr. Wardono, M.Si, Dr. Scolastika Mariani and Yuliyana Fathonah. 
Universitas Negeri  Semarang, Indonesia. 

6 Lampiran • Dipindai dengan Gmail 
  
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  



 
Wardono Unnes <wardono@mail.unnes.ac.id> 
 

Min, 2 Apr 
2017, 23.35

kepada editor, editorjatit, bcc: editor 

 
  
6 Lampiran • Dipindai dengan Gmail 

  
  

 
editor jatit <mailjatit@gmail.com> 
 

Sen, 3 Apr 
2017, 21.35

kepada saya 

 
 

Inggris 

Indonesia 
    
Terjemahkan pesan 

Nonaktifkan untuk: Inggris 

Dear Author 
 
We have received the paper, payment proof and copyright from your end.   
 
The paper shall appear in upcoming May 2017 Vol 95 Issue 10 of JATIT as per 
current slot allocation.  
  
The staff shall intimate you if anything else is required from your end. 
 
We shall encourage more quality submissions from you and your colleagues in 
future.  
 
Regards, 
 
Editorial Office  
Journal of Theoretical and Applied Information Technology 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 

 
Wardono Unnes <wardono@mail.unnes.ac.id> 
 

Sen, 3 Apr 
2017, 23.54

kepada editor 

 
 

Dear  Editor JATIT 
 
Thanks for the information. 
 
 
Regards, 
 
Dr. Wardono, M.Si, Dr. Scolastika Mariani, Yuliyana Fathonah 
 

 

BalasTeruskan 

 

31 Januari 2019 

Manuscript JATIT Wardono Scolastika Mariani Aida Eva 
Dianti 

 
Wardono Unnes <wardono@mail.unnes.ac.id> 
 

Kam, 31 Jan 
2019, 13.56

kepada editor, editor, editorjatit 

 
 

Dear Chief Editor of JATIT 
We have sent manuscripts to the JATIT website and via email. 
We hope that the manuscripst can be received and published at JATIT according to 
the procedure. 
We say thank you for your attention. 
Best regards, 
Wardono et al 

Satu lampiran • Dipindai dengan Gmail 
  

20 februari 2019 

Manuscript JATIT wardono Scolastika Mariani NN Afifa 
Eksternal 

Kotak Masuk 

 
Wardono Unnes <wardono@mail.unnes.ac.id> 
 

Rab, 20 Feb 
2019, 21.58



kepada editor, editor, bcc: editorjatit 

 
 

Dear Chief Editor of JATIT 
We have sent manuscripts to the JATIT website and via email. 
We hope that the manuscripst can be received and published at JATIT according to 
the procedure. 
We say thank you for your attention. 
Best regards, 
Wardono et al 

Satu lampiran • Dipindai dengan Gmail 
  

 
Mail Delivery System <Mailer-Daemon@core94.hostingmadeeasy.com> 
 

Rab, 20 Feb 
2019, 21.59

kepada saya 

 
 

Inggris 

Indonesia 
    
Terjemahkan pesan 

Nonaktifkan untuk: Inggris 

This message was created automatically by mail delivery software. 
 
A message that you sent could not be delivered to one or more of its 
recipients. This is a permanent error. The following address(es) failed: 
 
  editorjatit@gmail.com 
    (ultimately generated from editor@jatit.org) 
    Domain jatit.org has exceeded the max defers and failures per hour (5/5 (100%)) 
allowed. Message discarded. 
 

Satu lampiran • Dipindai dengan Gmail 
  

 

BalasTeruskan 

 

21 November 2019 

Successful Manuscript Submission to JATIT 
Kotak Masuk 

 
JATIT editor@jatit.org lewat core94.hostingmadeeasy.com  
 

Kam, 21 Nov 
2019, 23.31



kepada saya 

 
 

Inggris 

Indonesia 
    
Terjemahkan pesan 

Nonaktifkan untuk: Inggris 

We have received the manuscript for review and possible publication in Journal of 
Theoretical and Applied Information Technology. 
 
ID of the manuscript is " " and Password is " Ikudq " 
 
Please note the manuscript ID and use this as reference for correspondence 
regarding your submission. For updates on the status of your submission, please 
visit http://www.jatit.org/enter_manuscript.php. 
 
If you want to change your password, please use this 
URL: http://www.jatit.org/change_password.php 
 
Please fill the agreement form attached and mail it to mailjatit@gmail.com. 
Submitting this form confirms that you are in agreement with publication polices of 
the journal. You may also downlaod the agreement 
from http://www.jatit.org/agreement_form.docx 
 
Evaluation process can take 15-60 working days depending on the time the 
reviewers take to convey their opinion on your manuscript. 

Satu lampiran • Dipindai dengan Gmail 
  

 
JATIT editor@jatit.org lewat core94.hostingmadeeasy.com  
 

Jum, 22 Nov 
2019, 01.19

kepada saya 

 
 

Inggris 

Indonesia 
    
Terjemahkan pesan 

Nonaktifkan untuk: Inggris 

 
Satu lampiran • Dipindai dengan Gmail 

  

 
Wardono Unnes <wardono@mail.unnes.ac.id> 
 

Sel, 10 Des 
2019, 09.33 



kepada JATIT 

 
 

Dear Chief Editor JATIT 
I will check the status of the manuscript that we uploaded in the JATIT system, but in the email 
reply to us there is no username. We just got an email reply that ID of the manuscript is " " and 
Password is " Ikudq " ,  so we can not check the status manuscript . How to check our 
manuscript status? 
Thanks.   
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